Western Monmouth Purchasing Group
2022 Various Streets & Road Materials
Summary - Freehold Borough

The Walter R. Earle
Corporation

1800 Route 34, Bld. 2,
Suite 205

Wall, NJ 07719

Stavola Construction
Materials, Inc.
175 Drift Road

American Asphalt
Company Inc.
100 Main Street

Trap Rock Industries, LLC
P.O.Box 419

West Collingswood Tinton Falls, NJ 07724 Kingston, NJ 08528

Heights, NJ 08059

Item Description QTY [ Unit | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 [FABCTypel-5 100 Tons |$ 6440(S 6,44000|S 7800|S$ 7,800.00|$ 83.64|S$ 8,364.00 | No Bid S -
2 |FABC Type I-2 50 Tons |S 57.60(S 2,880.00| S 74.00|S 3,700.00|S 82.64|S 4,132.00 | No Bid S -
3 |Bituminous Cold Patch 200 | Tons |S 140.00 | S 28,000.00 | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
8 |High Performance Cold Patch 80 Tons |S 155.00| S 12,400.00 [$ 175.00 (S 14,000.00 | No Bid S - No Bid S -
10 |Sand (Ice Control) 200 | Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
11 |Soil Type 5 (3/4" Blend) 500 | Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
20 [Clean Fill Dirt 100 | Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
30 |Rock Salt 400 [ Tons | NoBid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -




Western Monmouth Purchasing Group
2022 Various Streets & Road Materials

Summary - Freehold Township

American Asphalt
Company Inc.
100 Main Street

West Collingswood
Heights, NJ 08059

Stavola Construction
Materials, Inc.
175 Drift Road

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

The Walter R. Earle

Corporation

1800 Route 34, Bld. 2,

Suite 205

Wall, NJ 07719

Trap Rock Industries, LLC

P.O. Box 419

Kingston, NJ 08528

Item Description QTY Unit | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 |[FABCType l-5 4000 | Tons |S 64.40|$257,600.00 S 78.00|S 312,000.00 (S 83.64 | $334,560.00 | No Bid S -
2 |FABC Type I-2 2000 | Tons |$ 57.60($115,200.00 S 74.00 | $ 148,000.00 [ S 82.64 | $165,280.00 | No Bid S -
3 |Bituminous Cold Patch 100 Tons | S 140.00 | S 14,000.00 | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
4 |Tac Coat Emulsion 100 Gals | No Bid S - No Bid S - S 25.00($ 2,500.00 | No Bid S -
10 [Sand (Ice Control) - At Plant 500 Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
10 |Sand (Ice Control) - Delivered 500 | Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
12 |Road Gravel/Bank Run Gravel 500 Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
18 [Rip Rap Stone 200 | Tons | NoBid S - S 62.75|$ 12,550.00 | No Bid S - No Bid S -
30 |Rock Salt - Delivered 4000 | Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
30 |Rock Salt - At Plant 500 | Tons | NoBid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
31 [Liquid Calcium Chloride 32% 15000| Gals | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
41 |[Recycled Concrete 1000 | Tons | No Bid S - S 25.75|S$ 25,750.00 | $ 15.00| S 15,000.00 | No Bid S -
42 |3/4 Clean Stone 500 Tons | No Bid S - S 30.75|S 15,375.00 | No Bid S - S 28.40|S 14,200.00
43 |Stone Dust 500 Tons | No Bid S - S 30.75|S$ 15,375.00 | No Bid S - S 2590 |$ 12,950.00
44 Dense Graded Aggregate Base

Course (D.G.A.B.C.) 1000 | Tons | No Bid S - S 30.75|S 30,750.00 | No Bid S - S 23.90|$ 23,900.00




Western Monmouth Purchasing Group
2022 Various Streets & Road Materials

Summary - Manalapan

American Asphalt Company
Inc.
100 Main Street

West Collingswood Heights,
NJ 08059

Stavola Construction
Materials, Inc.
175 Drift Road

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

The Walter R. Earle
Corporation

1800 Route 34, Bld. 2, Suite
205

Wall, NJ 07719

Trap Rock Industries, LLC

P.O. Box 419

Kingston, NJ 08528

Item Description QTY | Unit | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 |[FABC Type I-5 20000| Tons | S 64.40 | S 1,288,000.00 | S 78.00 | $1,560,000.00 | S 83.64|51,672,800.00 (S 78.00 | S 1,560,000.00
2 |FABC Type I-2 1000 | Tons | S 57.60 (S 57,600.00 | S 74.00 | S 74,000.00 | S 8264 |S 82,640.00|S 76.00|S 76,000.00
4 |Tac Coat Emulsion 500 | Gals | No Bid S - No Bid S - S 25.00|$ 12,500.00 | No Bid S -
6 |MABC1-4 2000 | Tons |$ 61.60|S 123,200.00 | S 78.00 | S 156,000.00 (S 83.64 (S 167,280.00|S 78.00 S 156,000.00
g High Performance Cold

Patch 100 | Tons | $ 861.00| S 86,100.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 16,000.00 | No Bid S - No Bid S -
10 |Sand (Ice Control) 200 | Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
13 3/4" Broken Stone,

Blended 400 | Tons | No Bid S - S 30.50 | $ 12,200.00 | No Bid S - S 21501(S 8,600.00
1s 1 1/2 Broken Stone,

Blended 400 | Tons | No Bid S - S 3250 | $ 13,000.00 | No Bid S - S 18.751(S 7,500.00
18 |Rip Rap Stone 400 | Tons | No Bid S - S 62.50|S 25,000.00 | No Bid S - S 35.00(S$ 14,000.00
30 |Rock Salt 500 | Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -

Pre-Mixed Rock Salt
32 |Sodium Chloride /

Calcium Chloride 6000 [ Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
43 |Stone Dust 2000 | Tons | No Bid S - S 30.50 | $ 61,000.00 | No Bid S - S 19.00 (S 38,000.00




Western Monmouth Purchasing Group
2022 Various Streets & Road Materials

Summary - Marlboro

American Asphalt
Company Inc.

100 Main Street

West Collingswood
Heights, NJ 08059

Stavola Construction
Materials, Inc.
175 Drift Road

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

The Walter R. Earle

Corporation

1800 Route 34, Bld. 2,

Suite 205

Wall, NJ 07719

Trap Rock Industries, LLC

P.O. Box 419

Kingston, NJ 08528

Item Description QTY [ Unit | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 [FABCTypel-5 5000| Tons |$ 64.40|$ 322,000.00 (S 78.00 | S 390,000.00 | No Bid S - S 78.00 | $ 390,000.00
2 |FABC Type I-2 2500 Tons | S 57.60| S 144,000.00 | S 74.00 | S 185,000.00 | No Bid S - S 76.00|S 190,000.00
3 [Bituminous Cold Patch 150 Tons |$ 140.00 [ S 21,000.00 | No Bid S - No Bid S - S 180.00 | $ 27,000.00
4 |Tac Coat Emulsion 500 | Gallons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
8 [High Performance Cold Patch 250 | Tons |S 140.00 | S 35,000.00 [$ 160.00 (S 40,000.00 | No Bid S - No Bid S -
10 [Sand (Ice Control) 1000| Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
13 |3/4" Broken Stone 500 Tons | No Bid S - S 30.25|S$ 15,125.00 | No Bid S - S 28.40|S$ 14,200.00
14 |1"and 1 1/2" Broken Stone, 250 | Tons | No Bid S - S 32.25|S 8,062.50 | No Bid S - S 3165|S 7,912.50
18A |Rip Rap Stone, D50=8" 200 Tons | No Bid S - S 62.25|S 12,450.00 | No Bid S - S 4248 |S 8,496.00
18B [Rip Rap Stone, D50=15" 200 | Tons | No Bid S - S 62.25|S 12,450.00 | No Bid S - S 47.00|S 9,400.00
30 |Rock Salt 1000| Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
35 |Pre-Mixed Rock Salt Sodium 6000| Tons | No Bid NoBid |$ - |NoBid |$ - |NoBid
Chloride / Calcium Chloride S - S -
33 |Pre-Mixed 75% Coarse Sand 2500| Tons | No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S - No Bid S -
41A [Recycled Concrete Aggregate 1500| Tons | No Bid S - S 25.25|S$ 37,875.00 | No Bid S - No Bid S -
41B Recycled Concrete Aggregate 3"
DIA 500 Tons | No Bid S - S 25.25|S$ 12,625.00 | No Bid S - No Bid S -
42 [3/4" Clean Stone 500 | Tons | No Bid S - S 30.25|S 15,125.00 | No Bid S - S 28.40|S 14,200.00
43 |Stone Dust 500 Tons | No Bid S - S 30.25|S$ 15,125.00 | No Bid S - S 19.00|S 9,500.00
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