
Marlboro Township                                                                                                                                                                       

Bid #2015-25B Recycling Collection                                                                                                                                      

Bid Opening: July 6, 2016 @ 10:00 AM     

Central Jersey Waste                       

& Recycling, , Inc.                                                  

432 Stokes Ave                                                       

Ewing, NJ 08638

Waste Management                                          

of New Jersey, Inc.                                          

107 Silvia Street                                               

Ewing, NJ 08628

Suburban Disposal                                                                                  

54 Montesano Road                                               

Fairfield, NJ 07004

SINGLE STREAM 

Year 1 $440,988.00 $474,000.00 No Bid

Option Year 2 $449,366.00 $485,844.00 No Bid

Option Year 3 $457,904.00 $495,000.00 No Bid

Option Year 4 $466,605.00 $504,000.00 No Bid

Option Year 5 $475,470.00 $514,200.00 No Bid

GRAND TOTAL - SINGLE STREAM $2,290,333.00 $2,473,044.00 No Bid

DUAL STREAM 

Year 1 $570,450.00 $680,400.00 No Bid

Option Year 2 $581,859.00 $694,008.00 No Bid

Option Year 3 $593,496.00 $707,880.00 No Bid

Option Year 4 $605,366.00 $722,028.00 No Bid

Option Year 5 $617,473.00 $736,464.00 No Bid

 GRAND TOTAL - DUAL STREAM $2,968,644.00 $3,540,780.00 No Bid


