
Bid # 2016-01                                                      

Coach Bus Transportation Services                 

for the Recreation Department 
Bid Opening: February 3, 2016 at 10:00 AM

Trip Location -- SENIOR PROGRAM Per 48/p Bus Per 56/p Bus Per 48/p Bus Per 56/p Bus Per 48/p Bus Per 56/p Bus

Spring Lake, NJ (Doolan’s) No Bid 745.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

West Hampton , NJ (Hunterdon Hills Playhouse) No Bid 925.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

Millburn, NJ (Paper Mill Playhouse) No Bid 845.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

Red Bank, NJ (Two River Theater) No Bid 630.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

Wayne, PA (Chanticleer /Margaret Kuo) No Bid 975.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 894.00

Lancaster, PA (American Music Theater/Fulton Steamboat Inn) No Bid 1,325.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 1,094.00

Elmsford, NY (Westchester Dinner Theater) No Bid 1,115.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 894.00

Toms River, NJ (River Lady Cruise) No Bid 780.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

Kennett Square, PA (Longwood Gardens) No Bid 1,145.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 1,094.00

New York City (Various, specific destinations TBD) No Bid 875.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 824.00

Smithville (Ocean County), NJ No Bid 970.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 894.00

Atlantic City, NJ (Casino TBD) No Bid 1,060.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 994.00

Atlantic Highlands, NJ (Shore Casino) No Bid 670.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

Long Branch, NJ (NJ Repertory Company) No Bid 755.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

Asbury Park, NJ (Culinary Education Center) No Bid 695.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

Morristown, NJ (Bickford Theater) No Bid 875.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

Philadelphia, PA (Various, specific destinations TBD) No Bid 950.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 894.00

Allentown, PA (Pines Theater) No Bid 1,085.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 994.00

Paradise, PA (Rainbow Dinner Theater) No Bid 1,325.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 1,094.00

Beach Haven, NJ (Surflight Theater) No Bid 965.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 894.00

Manahawkin, NJ (Ocean Professional Theater) No Bid 900.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

West Orange, NJ No Bid 900.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

Paterson, NJ No Bid 925.00 No Bid 1,100.00 No Bid 794.00

TOTAL No Bid 21,435.00 No Bid 25,300.00 No Bid 20,092.00

Handicap Bus Rate No Bid Same as above No Bid No Bid Same as above

Suburban Transit Corp.           

750 Somerset Street                 

New Brunswick, NJ 08901       

Starr Transit Co., Inc.                           

2531 East State Street                    

Trenton, NJ 08619

Stout's Charter Service, Inc.   

20 Irven Street                                      

Trenton, NJ 08638



Bid Opening: February 3, 2016 at 10:00 AM

Trip Location -- TRAVEL CAMP PROGRAM Buses Per 56/p Bus Extended Per 56/p Bus Extended Per 56/p Bus Extended

Island Beach State Park – Seaside Park, NJ 4 775.00 3,100.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Jenkinson’s Boardwalk – Point Pleasant, NJ 4 715.00 2,860.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Sandy Hook Beach – Sandy Hook, NJ 4 670.00 2,680.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Seven President’s Beach – Long Branch, NJ 4 755.00 3,020.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

The Funplex – Mt. Laurel, NJ 4 840.00 3,360.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 794.00 3,176.00

Jersey Shore Arena – Wall, NJ 4 700.00 2,800.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Medieval Times – Lyndhurst, NJ 4 820.00 3,280.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 744.00 2,976.00

Splashplex – East Hanover, NJ 4 860.00 3,440.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 744.00 2,976.00

Ice World Poolplex – Middletown, NJ 4 700.00 2,800.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Ocean County Park – Lakewood, NJ 4 700.00 2,800.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Casino Pier – Seaside park, NJ 4 775.00 3,100.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Tomahawk Lake – Sparta, NJ 4 940.00 3,760.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 794.00 3,176.00

Space Odyssey – Englewood, NJ 4 860.00 3,440.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 744.00 2,976.00

Blackbeard’s Cave – Bayville, NJ 4 760.00 3,040.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Skyzone – Ocean Township, NJ 4 780.00 3,120.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 744.00 2,976.00

Keansburg Amusement/Water Park – Keansburg, NJ 4 700.00 2,800.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Hurricane Harbor – Jackson, NJ 4 750.00 3,000.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Belmar Beach – Belmar, NJ 4 700.00 2,800.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

The Quarry Swim Club – Hopewell, NJ 4 780.00 3,120.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Adventure Aquarium – Camden, NJ 4 860.00 3,440.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 794.00 3,176.00

Lakewood Blue Claws – Lakewood, NJ 4 700.00 2,800.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Clementon Amusement Park & Splash World – Clementon, NJ 4 725.00 2,900.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 794.00 3,176.00

Somerset Patriots – Somerset, NJ 4 700.00 2,800.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

NY Red Bulls – Harrison, NJ 4 800.00 3,200.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Eagleswood Amusement Park – Staffordville, NJ 4 830.00 3,320.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 794.00 3,176.00

Branchburg Sports Complex – Branchburg, NJ 4 760.00 3,040.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

I PLAY America – Freehold, NJ 4 650.00 2,600.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Rockville Climbing Center –Hamilton, NJ 4 650.00 2,600.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Aberdeen Movie Theater – Aberdeen, NJ 4 665.00 2,660.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Amboy Roller Rink – South Amboy, NJ 4 680.00 2,720.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

AMF Strathmore Lanes – Aberdeen, NJ 4 665.00 2,660.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 694.00 2,776.00

Suburban Transit Corp.           

750 Somerset Street                 

New Brunswick, NJ 08901       

Starr Transit Co., Inc.                           

2531 East State Street                    

Trenton, NJ 08619

Stout's Charter Service, Inc.   

20 Irven Street                                      

Trenton, NJ 08638
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Liberty Science Center – Jersey City, NJ ** Extended day 4pm 

return
4 835.00 3,340.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 794.00 3,176.00

Splash Zone – Wildwood, NJ ** Extended day 4pm return 4 1,245.00 4,980.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 1,094.00 4,376.00

Sahara Sam’s – West Berlin, NJ ** Extended day 4pm return 4 895.00 3,580.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 894.00 3,576.00

Madison Square Garden – New York, NY ** Extended day 4pm 

return
4 865.00 3,460.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 824.00 3,296.00

Great Adventure – Jackson, NJ ** Extended day 4:30pm return 4 785.00 3,140.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 794.00 3,176.00

Philadelphia Zoo – Philadelphia, PA ** Extended day 4:30pm 

return
4 915.00 3,660.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 894.00 3,576.00

The Franklin Institute – Philadelphia, PA ** Extended day 4:30pm 

return
4 915.00 3,660.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 894.00 3,576.00

Buck’s County River Country – Point Pleasant, PA ** Extended day 

8am-4:30pm
4 950.00 3,800.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 894.00 3,576.00

Action Park – Vernon, NJ ** Extended day 8am-5pm 4 1,085.00 4,340.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 894.00 3,576.00

Dorney Park and Wildwater Kingdom – Allentown, PA**Extended 

day 8am-5pm
4 1,065.00 4,260.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 994.00 3,976.00

Camelbeach Mountain Waterpark – Tannersville, PA ** Extended 

day 8am-5pm
4 1,125.00 4,500.00 1,000.00 4,000.00 994.00 3,976.00

TOTAL 135,780.00 168,000.00 128,712.00

CANCELLATION FEE PER BUS (percentage) - < 24 hours notice 30% 5% 10%

CANCELLATION FEE PER BUS (percentage) - < 5 hours notice 50% 10% 25%


