
MARLBORO TOWNSHIP -- BID #2016-05 - T-SHIRTS

April 5, 2016, 10:00 AM

# Description Size
Est. 

Qty.

Unit           

Price
Extended Price

Unit           

Price
Extended Price

Unit           

Price
Extended Price

Youth 2,500 $2.60 $6,500.00 $2.60 $6,500.00 $3.70 $9,250.00

Adult 5,000 $2.64 $13,200.00 $2.60 $13,000.00 $3.70 $18,500.00

1B T-Shirt: Price for 8 inch number on back. (Cost for number only per shirt.) - 5,000 $0.49 $2,450.00 $0.75 $3,750.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

1C

T-Shirt: Repeat Screen Set-Up charge                                                            

Explanation: If the Township needs to produce less than the minimum order of 

12 T-Shirts in a separate order, what is the screen set-up charge, if any?                    

- 1 $0.00 $0.00 $10.00 $10.00 $40.00 $40.00

Youth 1 $3.25 $3.25 $4.00 $4.00 $40.00 $40.00

Adult 1 $3.25 $3.25 $4.00 $4.00 $40.00 $40.00

Youth 2,500 $0.00 $0.00 $0.25 $625.00 $0.10 $250.00

Adult 5,000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.25 $1,250.00 $0.10 $500.00

Youth 150 $9.25 $1,387.50 $13.50 $2,025.00 No Bid No Bid

Adult 500 $9.60 $4,800.00 $13.50 $6,750.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 10 $9.60 $96.00 $14.75 $147.50 No Bid No Bid

Youth 750 $8.39 $6,292.50 $9.50 $7,125.00 No Bid No Bid

Adult 850 $8.49 $7,216.50 $9.50 $8,075.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 10 $10.49 $104.90 * $11.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 10 $10.49 $104.90 * $12.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid

Adult 48 $5.60 $268.80 $7.50 $360.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 2 $6.60 $13.20 $8.50 $17.00 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 2 $8.60 $17.20 $10.50 $21.00 No Bid No Bid

Adult 20 $3.75 $75.00 $5.00 $100.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 10 $5.35 $53.50 $6.50 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 10 $5.35 $53.50 $6.50 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

Adult 300 $4.59 $1,377.00 * $4.50 $1,350.00 $9.40 $2,820.00 *

XXL 20 $6.39 $127.80 * $6.69 $133.80 $11.40 $228.00

XXXL 20 $6.39 $127.80 * $6.69 $133.80 $12.40 $248.00

Kenmar Shirts Inc.Campus Coordinates

1A

T-Shirt: Best or Fruit of the Loom Brand and/or equal 50% cotton 50% 

polyester.  Sample T-Shirt to be sent with Bid.  List all colors available 

(minimum 16).  Lettering approximately two to three inches high on front only.  

Lettering and insignias to be done in silk screen process.  Letters and numbers in 

white or black.

1D

T-Shirt: Cost for under minimum order                                                                                 

Explanation: If the Township needs to produce less than the minimum order of 

12 T-Shirts in a separate order, what is the cost per T-Shirt, as per Item 1A

T-Shirt Order to be separated by Division and Teams, and (numbered) labeled 

on box, which will be packaged by supplier as directed by this office.
1E

A4 brand or equal reversible 100% poly mesh basketball jersey (Screened on 

both fronts, #s on both backs)
3

6
Collared Golf Shirt (No Pocket) - Anvil Brand or Equal 50/50 style with 

screening process

5
Jerzee brand or equal 50/50 heavyweight preshrunk t-shirts (3-color full screen 

on front)

2
Yale brand or equal reversible 100% poly mesh soccer jersey (Screened on both 

fronts, #s on both backs) 1/2 in fall, 1/2 in spring

4 Sport-Tek Competitor Colorblock Performance T-shirt (Screened on left chest)

Dot Designing LLCRECREATION
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MARLBORO TOWNSHIP -- BID #2016-05 - T-SHIRTS

April 5, 2016, 10:00 AM

Adult 30 $4.59 $137.70 * $4.55 $136.50 No Bid No Bid

XXL 10 $5.74 $57.40 $5.89 $58.90 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 10 $5.74 $57.40 $5.89 $58.90 No Bid No Bid

Adult 30 $5.85 $175.50 $5.85 $175.50 $15.70 $471.00

XXL 10 $7.59 $75.90 $7.40 $74.00 $18.70 $187.00

XXXL 10 $7.59 $75.90 $7.40 $74.00 $19.70 $197.00

Adult 20 $4.21 $84.20 $4.42 $88.40 $12.50 $250.00

XXL 10 $5.75 $57.50 $5.92 $59.20 $14.50 $145.00

XXXL 10 $5.75 $57.50 $5.92 $59.20 $15.50 $155.00

Adult 40 $4.69 $187.60 * $4.75 $190.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 10 $6.69 $66.90 $6.65 $66.50 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 10 $6.69 $66.90 $6.85 $68.50 No Bid No Bid

Adult 20 $6.65 $133.00 $5.50 $110.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 10 $7.65 $76.50 $6.50 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 10 $7.65 $76.50 $6.50 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

Adult 20 $10.99 $219.80 $12.00 $240.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $11.99 $11.99 $13.00 $13.00 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 1 $13.99 $13.99 * $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid

Adult 20 $11.75 $235.00 $17.00 $340.00 No Bid No Bid

Sport-Tek brand or equal, light weight 100% poly windbreaker (apparel only) XXL 10 $12.75 $127.50 $18.00 $180.00 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 10 $14.75 $147.50 $20.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid

Screen front left chest per 40 $0.40 $16.00 $3.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid

Screen on back per 40 $0.25 $10.00 $3.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid

Adult 20 $31.00 $620.00 $29.00 $580.00 No Bid No Bid

Nike brand or equal, dri-fit golf polo 100% poly (apparel only) XXL 10 $32.00 $320.00 $30.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid

Men's Style 203690 XXXL 10 $33.75 $337.50 $32.00 $320.00 No Bid No Bid

Screen front left chest per 40 $0.40 $16.00 $3.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid

Screen on back per 40 $0.25 $10.00 $3.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid

Adult 20 $31.00 $620.00 $29.00 $580.00 No Bid No Bid

Nike brand or equal, dri-fit golf polo 100% poly (apparel only) XXL 10 $32.00 $320.00 $30.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid

Women's Style 203697 XXXL 10 $33.75 $337.50 $32.00 $320.00 No Bid No Bid

Screen front left chest per 40 $0.40 $16.00 $3.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid

Screen on back per 40 $0.25 $10.00 $3.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid

9

14M

14W

13

12

Sleeveless Gilden Brand or equal – Preshrunk 90% cotton - 10% polyester plus 

screening

Port Authority – Long Sleeve Value Poplin Shirt S632 Color: Royal  or Equal, 

screened

7
Long Sleeve T-Shirt – Anvil Brand or Equal – Preshrunk 90% cotton - 10% 

polyester plus screening.

Sweatshirts – Jerzees Brand or equal – 50/50 with screening

11 Razorback Best Brand or equal (tank) – 50/50, Screen on Front Heart

8

10
Collared Gilden Brand or equal – Preshrunk 50% cotton - 50% polyester plus 

screening
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Adult 20 $23.50 $470.00 $23.00 $460.00 No Bid No Bid

Sport-Tek brand or equal, 12oz superheavyweight full zipper hooded sweatshirt, XXL 10 $24.50 $245.00 $24.00 $240.00 No Bid No Bid

 80/20 cotton/poly blend (apparel only) XXXL 10 $25.60 $256.00 $26.00 $260.00 No Bid No Bid

Screen front left chest per 40 $0.25 $10.00 $2.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid

Screen on back per 40 $0.25 $10.00 $2.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid

16S
Port & Company brand LPC-54V or equal 5.4 oz 100% cotton V-neck T-shirt, 

screened
Adult 12 $4.00 $48.00 $4.88 $58.56 No Bid No Bid

16E
Port & Company brand LPC-54V or equal 5.4 oz 100% cotton V-neck T-shirt, 

embroidered
Adult 12 $7.00 $84.00 $8.88 $106.56 No Bid No Bid

17S
Sport -Tek brand LST-238 or equal Ladies sport-wick fleece full-zip hooded 

jacket, screened
Adult 12 $20.00 $240.00 $22.00 $264.00 No Bid No Bid

17E
Sport -Tek brand LST-238 or equal Ladies sport-wick fleece full-zip hooded 

jacket, embroidered
Adult 12 $24.00 $288.00 $26.00 $312.00 No Bid No Bid

18S
Gilden brand 8400 or equal dryblend 50/50 cotton/poly long sleeve t-shirts, 

screened
Adult 12 $4.49 $53.88 $4.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid

18E
Gilden brand 8400 or equal dryblend 50/50 cotton/poly long sleeve t-shirts, 

embroidered
Adult 12 $7.00 $84.00 $8.00 $96.00 No Bid No Bid

19S Port Authority brand L800 or equal EZ cotton Pique Polo, screened Adult 12 $13.00 $156.00 $15.00 $180.00 No Bid No Bid

19E Port Authority brand L800 or equal EZ cotton Pique Polo, embroidered Adult 12 $15.80 $189.60 $19.00 $228.00 No Bid No Bid

Youth/  

Adult
75 $8.39 $629.25 $8.25 $618.75 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $9.00 $9.00 $9.25 $9.25 No Bid No Bid

Youth/  

Adult
70 $10.00 $700.00 * $9.50 $665.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $11.25 $11.25 $10.50 $10.50 No Bid No Bid

Youth/  

Adult
70 $5.25 $367.50 $7.50 $525.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $5.25 $5.25 $8.50 $8.50 No Bid No Bid

Youth/  

Adult
75 $7.99 $599.25 $9.00 $675.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $7.99 $7.99 $10.00 $10.00 No Bid No Bid

Youth/  

Adult
75 $18.90 $1,417.50 $22.00 $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $18.90 $18.90 $24.00 $24.00 No Bid No Bid

Youth/  

Adult
75 $10.00 $750.00 $10.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 1 $10.50 $10.50 $12.00 $12.00 No Bid No Bid

Reversible Pinnies – Youth and adult sizes, printed on both sides,                          

No Numbers, Lacrosse

21
Champion brand Style CW26 or equal double dry interlock long sleeve 

performance shirt, front screen.

22
Champion brand Style CW22 or equal double dry short sleeve performance 

shirt, front screen.

23
Champion brand Style 8731 or equal long polyester performance shorts, front 

screen on left leg.

Champion brand Style P900 or equal 100% poly performance fleece pants, one 

leg screen.

24
Champion brand Style S220 or equal 5.4 oz 100% poly performance hooded 

sweatshirt, Two sided screen.

25

15

20
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Youth/  

Adult
12 $58.00 $696.00 $74.00 $888.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $58.00 $58.00 $76.00 $76.00 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 1 $58.00 $58.00 $78.00 $78.00 No Bid No Bid

Youth/  

Adult
12 $25.00 $300.00 $38.00 $456.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $25.00 $25.00 $40.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 1 $25.00 $25.00 $42.00 $42.00 No Bid No Bid

$56,870.65 * $66,149.82 $38,321.00 *

# Description Type
Est. 

Qty.

Unit         

Price
Extended Price

Unit         

Price
Extended Price

Unit         

Price
Extended Price

28
Tank top WHITE child's shirt ANVIL/AUGUSTA with printed emblem on front 

shirt. EMBLEM = multi color (5)

Youth 

(M,L,XL)
500 $3.62 $1,810.00 $4.08 $2,040.00 $7.10 $3,550.00

29
Tank top WHITE adult shirt ANVIL/AUGUSTA with printed emblem on front 

shirt. EMBLEM = multi color (5)
Adult (S,M) 500 $3.90 $1,950.00 $3.90 $1,950.00 $8.87 $4,435.00 *

30
Tank top BLUE  ADULT shirt ANVIL/AUGUSTA with printed LETTERS  on 

front shirt. PRINT = STAFF

Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
720 $4.89 $3,520.80 $4.50 $3,240.00 $9.30 $6,696.00

31
Tank top WHITE ADULT shirt ANVIL/AUGUSTA with printed lifeguard 

emblem on front/back. EMBLEM = 2 color

Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
800 $4.00 $3,200.00 $4.50 $3,600.00 $8.80 $7,040.00

32
Tank top WHITE ADULT shirt ANVIL/AUGUSTA with printed 

lifeguard/EMT emblem on front/back. EMBLEM = 2 color 

Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
48 $4.00 $192.00 $4.50 $216.00 $21.90 $1,051.20

Adult 60 $8.80 $528.00 $12.00 $720.00 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $10.30 $10.30 $14.00 $14.00 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 1 $10.30 $10.30 $14.50 $14.50 No Bid No Bid

Adult 72 $5.25 $378.00 $4.99 $359.28 $12.80 $921.60

XXL 1 $6.60 $6.60 $6.67 $6.67 $14.80 $14.80

XXXL 1 $6.60 $6.60 $6.99 $6.99 $15.80 $15.80

Youth 900 $3.25 $2,925.00 $2.45 $2,205.00 $4.40 $3,960.00

Adult 240 $3.25 $780.00 $2.45 $588.00 $4.40 $1,056.00

36
White T-Shirts  Best or Fruit of the Loom Brand and/or equal 50% cotton 50% 

polyester with screening (5 color)
Adult 36 $3.60 $129.60 $5.25 $189.00 $5.90 $212.40

$15,447.20 $15,149.44 $28,952.80 *

Kenmar Shirts Inc.Campus Coordinates

27

35
T-Shirts: Best or Fruit of the Loom Brand and/or equal 50% cotton 50% 

polyester with screening (5 color)

Collared Golf Shirt (No Pocket) – Anvil Brand #5002 or equal style with 

embroidery on left and right side

RECREATION SUBTOTAL 

34
Collared Golf Shirt (No Pocket) – Anvil Brand #5002 or Equal with screening 

process

26
Prosphere 'Counter Attack' Matman Sublimated Singlets or equal, Screened 

on back.

Matman Stock Singlets (#81, #83) or equal, Screened on back.

33

MARLBORO SWIM CLUB Dot Designing LLC

SWIM CLUB SUBTOTAL 
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# Description Type
Est. 

Qty.

Unit        

Price
Extended Price

Unit        

Price
Extended Price

Unit        

Price
Extended Price

37
T-Shirt: White with two color imprint on front, one color imprint on back, and two color 

imprint on sleeve

Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
75 $3.60 $270.00 $4.99 $374.25 No Bid No Bid

38
T-Shirt: Maroon with two color imprint on front, one color imprint on back, and two 

color imprint on sleeve

Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
75 $4.20 $315.00 $5.25 $393.75 No Bid No Bid

39
T-Shirt: Black with two color imprint on front, one color imprint on back, two colors on 

sleeve

Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
100 $4.50 $450.00 $5.25 $525.00 No Bid No Bid

40 T-Shirt: Blue with one color imprint on front, 2 color imprint on sleeve
Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
50 $4.10 $205.00 $4.45 $222.50 No Bid No Bid

41 T-Shirt: Maroon with one color imprint on front, 2 color imprint on sleeve
Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
50 $4.10 $205.00 $4.45 $222.50 No Bid No Bid

$1,445.00 $1,738.00 No Bid

# Description Type
Est. 

Qty.

Unit         

Price
Extended Price

Unit         

Price
Extended Price

Unit         

Price
Extended Price

Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
200 $2.30 $460.00 $2.44 $488.00 $3.57 $714.00

XXL 5 $3.29 $16.45 $3.71 $18.55 $5.57 $27.85

XXXL 1 $3.29 $3.29 $4.68 $4.68 $5.75 $5.75

Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
200 $2.69 $538.00 $2.55 $510.00 $4.57 $914.00

XXL 5 $3.89 $19.45 $3.97 $19.85 $6.57 $32.85

XXXL 1 $3.89 $3.89 $4.91 $4.91 $6.75 $6.75

$1,041.08 $1,045.99 $1,701.20

Kenmar Shirts Inc.

Kenmar Shirts Inc.

Campus Coordinates

Campus CoordinatesDot Designing LLC

PREVENTION OF DRUG AND ALCOHOL ALLIANCE Dot Designing LLC

ALLIANCE SUBTOTAL 

TEEN ADVISORY COMMITTEE/ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE SUBTOTAL 

42
T-Shirt: White, 50/50 Premium Heavyweight, short sleeve tee with 2 color 

navy/gold logo across full front

43
T-Shirt: Grey, 50/50 Premium Heavyweight, short sleeve tee with 2 color 

navy/gold logo across full front

TEEN ADVISORY COMMITTEE/ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE
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# Description Type
Est. 

Qty.

Unit        

Price
Extended Price

Unit        

Price
Extended Price

Unit        

Price
Extended Price

Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
14 $4.95 $69.30 $5.29 $74.06 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $5.99 $5.99 $6.59 $6.59 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 1 $5.99 $5.99 $7.09 $7.09 No Bid No Bid

Adult 

(S,M,L,XL)
14 $7.49 $104.86 $7.25 $101.50 No Bid No Bid

XXL 1 $8.75 $8.75 $9.10 $9.10 No Bid No Bid

XXXL 1 $8.75 $8.75 $10.40 $10.40 No Bid No Bid

$203.64 $208.74 No Bid

$75,007.57 * $84,291.99 $68,975.00 *

* Price adjusted for mathmatical error.

Kenmar Shirts Inc.Campus Coordinates

45
T-Shirt: Black, long sleeve pocket tee with 1 color white lettering "Marlboro 

Township" above left breast

VEHICLE MAINTENANCE SUBTOTAL 

GRAND TOTAL OF ALL SECTIONS 

44
T-Shirt: Black, short sleeve pocket tee with 1 color white lettering "Marlboro 

Township" above left breast

VEHICLE MAINTENANCE Dot Designing LLC
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