Marlboro Township

Bid #2016-09 Snow Removal Services

Bid Opening: Tuesday, May 3, 2016 @ 10:00AM

BASE BID No Set up Fee/Hourly Rate Only

Bidder Vehicle # of Vehicles Labor Cost Fuel Cost Insurance Cost TOTAL RATE
Description (per vehicle hour) |(per vehicle hour) |(per vehicle hour) (per vehicle hour)

Triple C Nurseries Class 1 4 $51.00 $9.00 $24.00 $290.00 /hour
Class 2 3 $51.00 $9.00 $24.00 $275.00 /hour
Class 3 3 $51.00 $9.00 $24.00 $260.00 /hour

L.J. Pesce, LLC Class 1 3 $40.00 $10.00 $25.00 $265.00 /hour
Class 2 1 $40.00 $10.00 $25.00 $265.00 /hour
Class 3 2 $40.00 $10.00 $25.00 $265.00 /hour

Lucas Construction Group, Inc. |Class 1 8 $275.00 $0.00 $0.00 $275.00 /hour
Class 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid /hour
Class 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid /hour

Tri County Turf, LLC Class 1 9 $50.00 $10.00 $55.00 $349.00 /hour
Class 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid /hour
Class 3 1 $50.00 $5.00 $55.00 $185.00 /hour

Premium Growers Inc. Class 1 8 $50.00 $10.00 $25.00 $290.00 /hour
Class 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |/hour
Class 3 6 $50.00 $10.00 $25.00 $260.00 /hour
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Marlboro Township

Bid #2016-09 Snow Removal Services

Bid Opening: Tuesday, May 3, 2016 @ 10:00AM

ALT. BID #2
Bidder

Triple C Nurseries

L.J. Pesce, LLC

Lucas Construction Group, Inc.

Tri County Turf, LLC

Premium Growers Inc.

Vehicle
Description
Class 1
Class 2
Class 3

Class 1
Class 2
Class 3

Class 1
Class 2
Class 3

Class 1
Class 2
Class 3

Class 1
Class 2
Class 3

w w

| NP W

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Set up Fee + Hourly Rate
# of Vehicles |Set up Fee

(per vehicle)

$3,000.00
$3,000.00
$3,000.00

$3,000.00
$3,000.00
$3,000.00

$500.00
No Bid
No Bid

$3,000.00
No Bid
$0.00

$3,000.00
No Bid
$3,000.00

TOTAL SET UP FEE

Labor Cost

(per vehicle hour)

$12,000.00
$9,000.00
$9,000.00

$9,000.00
$3,000.00
$6,000.00

$4,000.00
No Bid
No Bid

$27,000.00
No Bid
$0.00

$24,000.00
No Bid
$18,000.00
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$50.00
$50.00
$50.00

$40.00
$40.00
$40.00

$275.00
No Bid
No Bid

$50.00
No Bid
$50.00

$50.00
No Bid
$50.00

Fuel Cost
(per vehicle hour)

$11.00
$11.00
$11.00

$10.00
$10.00
$10.00

$0.00
No Bid
No Bid

$10.00
No Bid
$5.00

$10.00
No Bid
$10.00

Insurance Cost
(per vehicle hour)

$24.00
$24.00
$24.00

$25.00
$25.00
$25.00

$0.00
No Bid
No Bid

$55.00
No Bid
$55.00

$25.00
No Bid
$25.00

TOTAL RATE
(per vehicle hour)

$260.00 /hour
$245.00 /hour
$230.00 /hour

$250.00 /hour
$250.00 /hour
$250.00 /hour

$275.00 /hour
No Bid /hour
No Bid /hour

$289.00 /hour
No Bid /hour
$185.00 /hour

$260.00 /hour
No Bid /hour
$230.00 /hour



