Marlboro Township
Bid #2016-16 Uniforms for PD
Opening: August 2, 2016 at 10:00 AM

Red the Uniform Tailor, Inc.

475 Oberlin Ave So.
Lakewood, NJ 08701

I;?)M DESCRIPTION MAX. UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE
P-1A |Class A Pants 40 $99.95 $3,998.00
P-1B |Class A Pants 40 $99.95 $3,998.00
P-1C |Class A Pants 40 $99.95 $3,998.00
P-2 |BDU’s - Trouser 50 $56.99 $2,849.50
P-3 |BDU’s — Long Sleeve Shirt 50 $64.00 $3,200.00
P-4 |BDU’s — Short Sleeve Shirt 50 $58.00 $2,900.00
P-5A |Long sleeve Shirts-Blue 60 $99.50 $5,970.00
P-5B [Long sleeve Shirts-Blue 60 $76.00 $4,560.00
PG Long sleeve Shir.ts—Winter 13 $69.99 $1.259.82
Color: Snow white
Short sleeve Shirts-Summer
b7 Color: Police and Fire Blue 100 $99.95 $9,995.00
P8 Short sleeve ShiFtS-Summer 13 $67.50 $1.215.00
Color: Snow white
P-9a |Patch- American Flag 400 $1.50 $600.00
P-9b [Patch- Marlboro Township Police 400 $1.60 $640.00
P-9c |Patch- K-9 Police 16 $3.50 $56.00
p.og |Fatch- Corporal 240 $3.50 $840.00
Rank Insignia
p.ge |Fatch- Sergeant 200 $3.50 $700.00
Rank Insignia
pof |Patch- Licutenant 100 $3.50 $350.00
Rank Insignia
Patch- Captain
P-9g Rank Insignia 40 $3.50 $140.00
pop |Latch- Chief 20 $3.50 $70.00
Rank Insignia
P-9i |[Embroidered Badges (all ranks) 200 $2.00 $400.00
P-9j |Embroidered Service Stars 600 $2.00 $1,200.00
P-9k |Special Patches 50 $2.50 $125.00
P-91 |Animal Control Patch 40 $2.50 $100.00
P-10 [Tie 70 $5.00 $350.00
P-11A  |Leather Boots ZIP 40 $119.00 $4,760.00
P-11B |Leather Boots/Non Zip 25 $125.00 $3,125.00
P-11C |Highs Gloss 5 $95.50 $477.50
P-11D |Sport Shoe 3 $102.50 $307.50
P-12 [Chukka Shoes 25 $129.00 $3,225.00
P-13 |Raincoat 12 $49.99 $599.88
P-14 |Car Duty Jacket 15 $245.50 $3,682.50
P-15 |Sweater 10 $135.00 $1,350.00
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P-16 |Class A Hats 10 $52.50 $525.00
P-17 |Helmet 2 No Bid No Bid

P-18 |Lightweight Jacket 20 $135.00 $2,700.00
P-19 |Name Plate Gold 15 $11.50 $172.50
P-20 |Name Plate Silver 20 $9.50 $190.00
P-21 |Class A Hat Cover 10 $11.25 $112.50
P-22 |Leather Under-belt 15 $28.50 $427.50
P-23 |Leather Duty Belt 12 $64.50 $774.00
P-24 |Leather OC Holder 12 $28.50 $342.00
P-25 |Leather Glove Holder 12 $17.50 $210.00
P-26 [Double Mag Pouch 12 $35.50 $426.00
P-27 |Leather Handcuff Case 12 $30.50 $366.00
P-28 |[Belt Keepers 60 $5.25 $315.00
P-29 |Hide Away Keepers 12 $19.50 $234.00
P-30 [Duty Holster 9 $173.00 $1,557.00
P-31 |Off Duty Holster 9 $46.50 $418.50
P-32 |Dress Blouse Ptlm/Sgt 35 $160.00 $5,600.00
P-33 |Watch Cap - Lined 10 $31.99 $319.90
P-34  [Mock Turtleneck Dickey 50 $14.99 $749.50
P-35 |Stretch Fit Hat 25 $11.50 $287.50
P-36 |Dress Blouse Commanders 3 $450.00 $1,350.00
P-37 |M.T. - Collar Brass 15 $9.00 $135.00
P-38 |P.D. - Collar Brass 15 $9.00 $135.00
P-39 |Custom Tie Bar 15 $22.95 $344.25
P-40 |Foul Weather Jacket 11 $129.00 $1,419.00
P-41 |Foul Weather Pants 11 $88.50 $973.50
SO-1 [Class A Special Long Sleeve 8 $62.50 $500.00
SO-2 |Class A Special Short Sleeve 8 $60.50 $484.00
SO-3  [Polo Shirt Long Sleeve 8 $55.00 $440.00
SO-4 |Polo Shirt Short Sleeve 8 $35.00 $280.00
D-1 [Class A Pants 20 $36.99 $739.80
D-2 [Long Sleeve Polo 20 $55.00 $1,100.00
D-3 |Short Sleeve Polo 20 $48.50 $970.00
D-4 [Dispatcher Fleece 8 $39.99 $319.92
D-5 |Duty Belt 20 $24.00 $480.00
D-6 |Boots 20 $119.00 $2,380.00
D-7 |[IT Technician S/S Shirts 5 $45.00 $225.00
D-8 |[IT Technician Trousers 5 $43.00 $215.00
E-1 |Evidence Technician L/S Polo 4 $49.00 $196.00
E-2 |Evidence Technician S/S Polo 4 $45.00 $180.00
E-3 |Evidence Technician Trousers 4 $45.00 $180.00
M-1 |Motorcycle Helmet 1 No Bid No Bid

M-2 |Breeches -Winter 1 $199.00 $199.00
M-3  |Breeches - Summer 1 $199.00 $199.00
M-4 |Crush Hat 1 $59.50 $59.50
M-5 |Shoulder Strap Leather 1 $58.00 $58.00
M-6 |High Trooper Boots 1 $259.00 $259.00
M-7 |Rain Coat 1 $259.00 $259.00
M-8 |Rain Pant 1 $228.00 $228.00

Page 2 of 4



M-9 |Leather Jacket 1 $339.00 $339.00
M-10 [Gauntlet Gloves 1 No Bid No Bid
M-11 [Motor Wing Patch 5 $2.50 $12.50
HG-1 |Dress Blouse 3 $499.00 $1,497.00
HG-2 |Trouser 3 $115.00 $345.00
HG-3 |HAT/Pershing 3 $60.00 $180.00
HG-4 |Gun Belt 3 $69.50 $208.50
HG-5 [Shoulder Strap 3 $51.00 $153.00
HG-6 |Handcuff Case 3 $38.50 $115.50
HG-7 |Mag Pouch 3 $44.50 $133.50
HG-8 |Holster 3 $145.00 $435.00
HG-9 |[Single Style Flag Carrier 3 $55.00 $165.00

HG-10 |Shoes 3 $110.00 $330.00
HG-11 |White Gloves 10 $5.00 $50.00
HG-12 [Bag 5 $59.50 $297.50

B-1 |Cargo Short 3 $49.50 $148.50

B-2 |Cargo Pant 3 $86.50 $259.50

B-3 |L/S Shirt 3 $47.50 $142.50

B-4 [S/S Shirt 3 $45.00 $135.00

B-5 |Bike Patrol Jacket 3 $155.50 $466.50

B-6 |Bike Sneakers 3 $72.50 $217.50

B-7 |Bike Gloves 3 $43.50 $130.50

B-8 |Web Inner Belt 3 $13.50 $40.50

B-9 |Web Duty Belt 3 $21.50 $64.50
B-10 |Web Keepers 12 $10.25 $123.00
B-11 |Web Cuff Case 5 $16.50 $82.50
B-12 [Web OC Holder 3 $12.50 $37.50
B-13 |[Web Double Mag Holder 3 $19.00 $57.00
B-14 [Hard Shell Holster 3 $141.00 $423.00
B-15 |Web Radio Holder 3 $13.50 $40.50

F-1 |BDU Pant 5.11 15 $42.50 $637.50

F-2 |BDU Pant Tru-spec 15 $44.50 $667.50

F-3  |Polo Shirt SS 15 $48.00 $720.00

F-4 |Hooded Sweatshirt (Red 4 $37.50 $150.00

F-5 |[Short Sleeve Performance T-Shirt 15 $35.00 $525.00

F-6 |Long Sleeve T-Shirt 15 $37.00 $555.00

F-7  |Crew Sweatshirt 4 $36.00 $144.00

F-8 |Foul Weather Gear Jacket 5 $83.85 $419.25

F-9 |Foul Weather Gear Pants 5 $51.10 $255.50

F-10 |Flight Suit 3 $179.00 $537.00

R-1 |Long Sleeve Shirt 20 $28.00 $560.00

R-2 |Trousers 20 $28.00 $560.00

R-3 [Ties 5 $6.00 $30.00

R-4 |Plain Garrison Belt 5 $22.00 $110.00

R-5 |High Gloss Shoe 5 $38.00 $190.00

R-6 |Baseball Style Hat (Black) 5 $11.00 $55.00

R-7 |Gym Shorts 10 $19.50 $195.00

R-8 |Gym T-Shirt 10 $19.00 $190.00

R-9 [Sweat Suit 5 $49.00 $245.00
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R-10 |Running Belt 5 $19.50 $97.50
R-11 |Black Knit Cap 5 $4.00 $20.00
R-12 |BDU Pants 5 $42.50 $212.50
R-13 |Hooded Sweatshirt 5 $29.95 $149.75
R-14 |Academy Bag Black Canvas Large 5 $44.50 $222.50
K-1 [Polo Long Sleeve 2 $56.25 $112.50
K-2 |Polo Short-Sleeve 2 $42.00 $84.00
K-3 [BDU Pants 4 $42.50 $170.00
K-4 [Performance T-Shirts 2 $30.00 $60.00
K-5 [Hooded Zip Sweatshirt 1 $39.50 $39.50
K-6 |[Crew Sweat Shirt 1 $35.00 $35.00
K-7 |Hooded Pull Over 1 $39.50 $39.50
K-8 [Handcuff Case 1 $19.00 $19.00
K-9 [Double Magazine 1 $26.00 $26.00
K-10 |Belt Keepers 5 $5.25 $26.25
S-1 |S/S Polo Shirt 15 $42.00 $630.00
S-2 |L/S Polo Shirt 15 $56.25 $843.75
S-3  |BDU Pants 5.11 15 $42.50 $637.50
O-1 [Jacket LEPC 3 $62.00 $186.00
0-2  [S/S POLO LEPC 5 $47.50 $237.50
0-3 [S/S POLO CERT 12 $53.50 $642.00
0-4 |L/S POLO LEPC 5 $45.00 $225.00
O-5 |[L/S POLO CERT 12 $53.50 $642.00

$115,810.07

* Amounts adjusted for error in calculation.
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