

Marlboro Township
 Bid #2017-07 Snow Removal Services
 Bid Opening: Wed, May 31, 2017 @ 2:00 PM

BASE BID	No Set up Fee/Hourly Rate Only							
Bidder	Vehicle	# of Vehicles		Equipment Cost	Labor Cost	Fuel Cost	Insurance Cost	TOTAL RATE
	Desc.			(per vehicle hour)	(per vehicle hour)	(per vehicle hour)	(per vehicle hour)	(per vehicle hour)
L.J. Pesce, LLC	Class 1	3		\$210.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$285.00 /hr
	Class 2	1		\$210.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$285.00 /hr
	Class 3	2		\$180.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$255.00 /hr
Tri County Turf, LLC	Class 1	9		\$248.00	\$55.00	\$10.00	\$40.00	\$353.00 /hr
	Class 2	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Class 3	1		\$150.00	\$55.00	\$5.00	\$40.00	\$250.00 /hr
Premium Growers Inc.	Class 1	8		\$195.00	\$50.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$280.00 /hr
	Class 2	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Class 3	6		\$134.00	\$50.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$219.00 /hr

Marlboro Township
 Bid #2017-07 Snow Removal Services
 Bid Opening: Wed, May 31, 2017 @ 2:00 PM

ALT. BID #2	Set up Fee + Hourly Rate								
Bidder	Vehicle	# of Vehicles	Set up Fee	TOTAL SET UP FEE	Equipment Cost	Labor Cost	Fuel Cost	Insurance Cost	TOTAL RATE
	Desc.		(per vehicle)		(per vehicle hour)	(per vehicle hour)	(per vehicle hour)	(per vehicle hour)	(per vehicle hour)
L.J. Pesce, LLC	Class 1	3	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	\$165.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$240.00 /hr
	Class 2	1	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$165.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$240.00 /hr
	Class 3	2	\$500.00	\$1,000.00	\$135.00	\$40.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$210.00 /hr
Tri County Turf, LLC	Class 1	9	\$3,000.00	\$27,000.00	\$173.00	\$55.00	\$10.00	\$40.00	\$278.00 /hr
	Class 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Class 3	1	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$150.00	\$55.00	\$5.00	\$40.00	\$250.00 /hr
Premium Growers Inc.	Class 1	8	\$3,000.00	\$24,000.00	\$165.00	\$50.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$250.00 /hr
	Class 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Class 3	6	\$500.00	\$3,000.00	\$104.00	\$50.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$189.00 /hr