

Marlboro Township
Bid #2018-01 Chemicals
Wednesday, January 31, 2018 @ 10:00AM

Contract	Chemical Name	Est. Annual Qty.	Unit	Miracle Chemical Co. 1151B Highway 33 Farmingdale, NJ 07727	Kuehne Chemical Company, Inc. 80 N. Hackensack Ave. South Kearny, NJ 07032	Main Pool and Chemical Co Inc. 110 Commerce Road Dupont, PA 18641	Coyne Chemical 3015 State Road Croydon, PA 19021	Klenzoid, Inc. 912 Spring Mill Ave. Conshohocken, PA 19428	Reed & Perrine Sales 396 Main Street Tennent, NJ 07763
1A	Liquid Chlorine	7,500	lbs.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.9787 22,340.25	No Bid	No Bid
1B	Hydrated Lime	175,000	lbs.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.3880 67,900.00	No Bid	0.1984 34,720.00
1C	Zinc Orthophosphate	33,000	lbs.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.7231 23,862.30	0.565 18,645.00	No Bid
1D	Sodium Hypochlorite	90,000	gal.	1.589 143,010.00	2.10 189,000.00	1.485 133,650.00	1.703 153,270.00	No Bid	No Bid
1E	Sodium Hydroxide	125,000	gal.	No Bid	1.4667 183,337.50	1.37 171,250.00	2.41 301,250.00	No Bid	No Bid

Contract	Swim/Aquatic Center Pool Chemicals	Est. Weekly Qty.	Unit	Miracle Chemical Co. 1151B Highway 33 Farmingdale, NJ 07727	Kuehne Chemical Company, Inc. 80 N. Hackensack Ave. South Kearny, NJ 07032	Main Pool and Chemical Co Inc. 110 Commerce Road Dupont, PA 18641	Coyne Chemical 3015 State Road Croydon, PA 19021	Klenzoid, Inc. 912 Spring Mill Ave. Conshohocken, PA 19428	Reed & Perrine Sales 396 Main Street Tennent, NJ 07763
1F	Sodium Hypochlorite	750	gal.	1.589 1,191.75	No Bid	1.485 1,113.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Sodium Bicarbonate	10	bags	22.99 229.90	No Bid	18.75 187.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Calcium Chloride	10	bags	20.00 200.00	No Bid	17.75 177.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Sodium Thiosulfate	2	bags	43.99 87.98	No Bid	38.50 77.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid