Suzaiine Branagan

From: Brandon Stacey <BStacey@marlboropd.org>
Sent: Wednesday, April 1, 2020 12:58 PM

To: Suzanne Branagan

Subject: RE: GFY SERVICES

[CAUTION-EXTERNAL EMAIL]

Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.
Hey Suzanne,

So from what | see | have no issues with the project.

Ty...brandon

From: Suzanne Branagan [mailto:sbranagan@marlboro-nj.gov]

Sent: Friday, March 27, 2020 2:46 PM

To: Giddings, Joe; 'robert.nash@rve.com'; Chris Weltner: 'douglastilton@hotmail.com'; Brandon Stacey

Cc: ASpota

Subject: FW: GFY SERVICES

Hello all,

This is a use variance. Attached are related document — sans plans, so you can determine as to whether you need to view the plans.

Plans are in share file. If you need assistance with setting up a share file account. Let me know. IT might need to assist.

Postal service is a challenge, hence sending this electronically.

Fire prevention will receive a copy of the plans.

Thank you.



Susan A. Branagan, RMC
Deput;,; Municipal Clerk
Township of Marlboro
1979 Township Drive
Marlboro, NJ 07746-2247

Office: 732-536-0200 ext.: 1235
Fax: 732-972-6928

From: Suzanne Branagan

Sent: Friday, March 27, 2020 2:30 PM

To: Susan Penna (spenna@weiner.law) <spenna@weiner.law>; 'rkirtis@weiner.law' <rkirtis@weiner.law>; Neumann, Laura (lauran@cmeusal.com)
<lauran@cmeusal.com>

Cc: SParis <SParis@marlboro-nj.gov>

Subject: GFY SERVICES

This is a new application in share file. After Sarah processes escrow, we will have a ZB number.
Sarah,

We received two checks: application fee: $1250.00 and $7500 escrow.

Thank you.

Susan A. Branagan, RMC

Deputy Municipal Clerk

Township of Marlboro

1979 Township Drive

Marlboro, NJ 07746-2247

Office: 732-536-0200 ext.: 1235
Fax: 732-972-6928

Notice: This message may contain confidential and/or proprietary information and is intended for the person/entity to whom it was originally
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